
VENDOR
1. 2. 3. 4. 5. 6. 7.

424-A 424-A 424-B 424-B 424-C 424-C 424-C
WEARING WEARING LEVELING LEVELING WIDENING WIDENING PATCHING

1/2" 3/4" 3/4" 1" 1" 1 1/2" 1"

APAC Alabama/Midsouth 
Paving Inc. Birmingham, AL $81.00 $78.00 $76.00 $74.00 $74.00 $72.00 $74.00

Rogers Group Inc. Huntsville, 
AL $68.00 $66.00 $60.00 $57.00 $57.00 $57.00 $57.00

Vulcan Materials Company            
Birmingham, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Wiregrass Construction 
Guntersville, AL $73.75 $72.00 $61.00 $56.50 $56.50 $57.00 $56.50

Wright Construction Co. 
Huntsville, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Grayson Carter & Son 
Construction Inc.                       

Athens, AL $68.00 $66.00 $66.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00

     All Bids Rejected Based Upon Hauling Distance of Lowest Responsible Bidder

BID OPENING DATE:   2:00 PM   SEPTEMBER 2, 2025

BID PRICES PER TON

MARSHALL COUNTY COMMISSION
424 BLOUNT AVENUE

GUNTERSVILLE  AL  35976

BID TABULATION FOR BID #23-25
HOT BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT  (F.O.B. PLANT)


	Sheet1

